
Institution: _________________________     Submission:  ___of___
Rater: _______________________________    

   Discipline :  ______________________________________ 

Criteria Comments Available 
Points 

Actual 
Points 

1. Evidence that the institution’s mission is 
concordant with the Strategic Plans of the State 
University System Strategic Plan and of the State’s 
for economic development, and that the institution 
places an emphasis on one or more emerging 
technologies or academic disciplines that could 
favorably impact the state’s economic future as 
envisioned by the 21st Century Technology, 
Research, and Scholarship Enhancement Act. 

0 - 10 

2. Evidence that the institution currently has a 
distinguished faculty with national visibility and 
reputation and a substantial history of receiving 
external funding in the form of contracts and 
grants in academic disciplines directly associated 
with or applicable to the contemplated 21st Century 
World Class Scholar hire. 

0 - 10 

3. Evidence that the institution has outstanding 
students in the academic disciplines associated 
with the 21st Century World Class Scholar hire.  
This may include national rankings of academic 
disciplines, noteworthy alumni; student and 
graduate awards, honors, and other forms of 
recognition; and numbers of undergraduates 
accepted into nationally recognized graduate or 
professional programs. 

0 - 5 

4. Evidence of the presence of adequate research and 
scholarly support services as an institution as a 
whole and in academic disciplines associated with 
or applicable to the contemplated 21st Century 
World Class Scholar hire. This includes evidence 
of a long-standing Office of Research with an 
established record of securing, maintaining, and 
complying with federal grants in STEM disciplines; 
and institutional support of faculty in STEM 
disciplines appropriate to the creation of nationally 
recognized programs. 

0 - 5 



Institution: _________________________     Submission:  ___of___
Rater: _______________________________    

   Discipline :  ______________________________________ 

Criteria Comments Available 
Points 

Actual 
Points 

5. Evidence of the presence of an academic 
environment with appropriate infrastructure, 
buildings, classrooms, libraries, laboratories, and 
specialized equipment conducive to conducting the 
highest quality of scholarship and research faculty 
in academic disciplines directly associated with or 
applicable to the contemplated 21st Century World 
Class Scholar hire. 

0 - 10 

6. Inclusion of information currently available 
regarding the contemplated hire and the 
proposed academic field of recruitment and, if 
known, the name of the contemplated 21st Century 
Scholar. Evidence of the candidate’s record of 
attracting federal and foundation research funds, 
the candidate’s ability to assist in the building of 
nationally recognized academic programs, and the 
candidate’s experience in establishing relationships 
with industry to commercialize technologies.  
Evidence of a timeline for hiring. 

0 - 35 

7. Inclusion of spreadsheet, indicating the amount, 
source, and location of the institution’s matching 
funds to be put toward the contemplated 21st 

Century World Class Scholar hire.  Inclusion of a 
detailed expenditure plan associated with the 
proposed 21st Century hire, including specific 
amounts for endowments, salaries, facilities and 
equipment, stipends and fellowships, and other 
start-up costs.  Inclusion of no more than one page 
of narrative detail as necessary. 

0 - 25 

Total = 
100 


